
 
 

THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY AND 
COUNTY OF SWANSEA 

CYNGOR DINAS A SIR ABERTAWE 
 

TRAFFIC REGULATION ORDER  
 

TERRACE INN DEVELOPMENT, BIRCHGROVE 
 

NOTICE 2013 
 
NOTICE is hereby given that the Council of the City and County of Swansea 
did on the 15th day of July 2013 make an Order in pursuance of its powers as 
contained in the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (as amended) (“the Act”) 
and the Traffic Management Act 2004 the effect of which is as set out in the 
Schedules below. The Order shall come into operation on 22nd day of July 
2013. A copy of the Order and an appropriate plan may be inspected during 
normal office hours in the Legal, Democratic Services and Procurement 
Department at the Civic Centre Oystermouth Road Swansea (via application 
to main reception quoting reference DVT.1806/MAW) Any person wishing to 
challenge the Order on the grounds that it is not within the powers of the Act 
or that any requirements thereof, or of any instrument made thereunder have 
not been complied with may apply to the High Court at the Cardiff District 
Registry 2 Park Street Cardiff CF1 1ET within six weeks of the making of the 
Order for that purpose. 
 

SCHEDULES 
 

SCHEDULE 1 
REVOCATIONS 
 
The existing Orders are revoked insofar as they are inconsistent with the 
proposals hereinafter contained which relate to the length or lengths of the 
road or roads referred to in the schedules hereto. 
 
SCHEDULE 2 
Permit Holder Parking Only 
 
Birchgrove Road  
 
North Western Side 
 
From a point 14 metres north east to a point 83 metres north east of its 
junction with the north eastern kerb line of Birchgrove Road (access road to 
new development), a distance of 69 metres. Permits will be issued on 
eligibility.  
 
SCHEDULE 3 
Prohibition of Waiting at Any Time 
 
Birchgrove Road 
 
North Western Side 



 
From its junction with the north eastern kerb line of Birchgrove Road (access 
road to development) for a distance of 14 metres in a north easterly direction. 
 
From its junction with the south western kerb line of Birchgrove Road (access 
road to development) for a distance of 10 metres in a south westerly direction 
 
Birchgrove Road (access road to development). 
 
North Eastern Side 
 
From its junction with the north western kerb line of Birchgrove Road for a 
distance of 5 metres in a north westerly direction. 
 
South Western Side 
 
From its junction with the north western kerb line of Birchgrove Road for a 
distance of 5 metres in a north westerly direction. 
 
 
Dated this 15th day of July 2013  
 
PATRICK ARRAN 
HEAD OF LEGAL, DEMOCRATIC SERVICES AND PROCUREMENT 
PENNAETH GWASANAETHAU CYFREITHIOL, DEMOCRATAIDD A  
CHAFFAEL 
CIVIC CENTRE  
CANOLFAN DDINESIG 
SWANSEA 
ABERTAWE 

                                                                             
 
 


