
The County of Cornwall (Falmouth) (Cliff Road and Melvill Road) (Restrictions on Waiting) 
(Amendment) Order 2009 

 
 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on the 30th day of March 2011 the Council made the above 
Order operational from 21st April 2011 to implement waiting restrictions in Falmouth as specified 
in the Schedule below. 

 
The Order, the relevant maps and statement of reasons may be inspected during the opening 
hours of (i) ONE STOP SHOP, 34 Church Street, Falmouth, TR11 3EF; (ii) Cornwall Council’s 
Environment, Planning and Economy Department, Western Group Centre, Radnor Road, 
Scorrier, Redruth, TR16 5EH.  Further information can be obtained by telephoning 0300 1234 
222. 
 
Any person wishing to question the validity of the Order or any provision thereof on the grounds 
that it is not within the powers conferred by the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 or that a 
requirement of that Act or any relevant regulation made thereunder has not been complied with 
may, within 6 weeks from the 30th March 2011 make application for the purpose to the High Court. 
 

SCHEDULE 
No waiting at any time 

 
Cliff Road (U6058) - north side – (i) from its junction with Gyllyngvase Hill to a point 52 metres 
east of its junction with Gyllyngvase Road; (ii) from a point 122 metres east of its junction with 
Gyllyngvase Road for a distance of 43 metres in an easterly direction; (iii) from a point 110 metres 
west of its junction with De Pass Road for a distance of 82 metres in a westerly direction; (iv) from 
a point 26 metres west of its junction with De Pass Road for a distance of 38 metres in a westerly 
direction; south side – (i) from a point opposite a point 3 metres west of the centre of its junction 
with Gyllyngvase Hill for a distance of 110 metres in an easterly direction; (ii) from a point 176 
metres east of a point opposite the centre of its junction with Gyllyngvase Hill for a distance of 44 
metres in an easterly direction; (iii) from a point 110 metres west of a point opposite its junction 
with De Pass Road for a distance of 80 metres in a westerly direction 
 
Gyllyngvase Hill (U6058) – east side - from its junction with Cliff Road for a distance of 14 
metres in a northerly direction 
 
Gyllyngvase Terrace (U6058) – both sides - from its junction with Melvill Road for a distance of 
15 metres in a south-easterly direction. 
 
Gyllyngvase Road (U6058) – both sides - from its junction with Cliff Road for a distance of 16 
metres in a north-easterly direction 
 
Melvill Road (A39) – north side - from its junction with Avenue Road for a distance of 51 metres 
in an easterly direction; south side - from its junction with Gyllyngvase Road to a point 35 metres 
east of its junction with Gyllyngvase Terrace 
 
TOM FLANAGAN 
Corporate Director 


