
Dated 9

	

2010

CHILTERN DISTRICT COUNCIL

OFF-STREET PARKING PLACES AMENDMENT (No. 7) ORDER

2010



CHILTERN DISTRICT COUNCIL

OFF-STREET PARKING PLACES AMENDMENT (No. 7) ORDER 2010

The Council of the Chiltern District in the County of Buckinghamshire (hereinafter

referred to as "the Council") in exercise of its powers under Section 35(1) and (3)

and under Part IV of Schedule 9 of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 ("the

Act") as amended by the Parking Act 1989, the Traffic Management Act 2004 ("the

2004 Act") and all Regulations and Orders made in exercise of the powers conferred

by the 2004 Act and all other enabling powers, with the consent of the

Buckinghamshire County Council in accordance with Section 39(3) of the Act and

after consulting the Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part III of Schedule 9

of the Act, HEREBY MAKES the following Order:-

(1) This Order is supplemental to the Chiltern District Council

	

Off-Street Parking Places Order 2004 (as amended) ("the Original

Order") which subject as hereinafter mentioned remains in full force

and effect.

(2) This Order shall come into operation on 1 April 2010 and may

be cited as the Chiltern District Council Off-Street Parking Places

Amendment (No. 7) Order 2010 ("the Amendment Order").

(3) Definitions are set out in the Original Order.

2.

	

Row 3, Column 3 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

After "Up to 3 hours - £ 1.70" insert "Up to 4 hours - £2.20" and "Over 4

hours - £3.20".

3.

	

Row 3, Column 4 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

Insert "No Limit".



4.

		

Row 3, Column 5 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

	

Delete "No Season Tickets" and insert "Imonth - £62.40 3 months - £187.20

6 months - £332.80 12 months - £624. 00 Group B".

5. (1) Row 18 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended to include the existing row which will become the "upper

row" and a new "lower row".

(2)

	

Column 6 in the upper row delete "Not Permitted" and insert "Class 5

vehicles Not Permitted".

(3)

	

Column 2 in the lower row under the heading of "Class" insert "6".

(4)

	

Column 2 in the lower row under the heading of "Position" insert

"Wholly within a marked bay allocated for Class 6 vehicles".

(5)

	

Column 4 in the lower row insert "2 hours".

(6)

	

Column 6 in the lower row insert "Class 6 vehicles Permitted. No

Charge."

6.

		

Paragraph 6(iii) of Part II of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

After "shall not cause a vehicle" insert "in Class 1, 2, 3 or 4".

7.

		

After Paragraph 6(iii) of Part II of the Schedule of the Original Order insert

the following:

"iv) A driver shall not cause a vehicle in Class 6 to wait or permit it to be

left in the designated marked bay for Class 6 vehicles in the parking

place for more than 2 hours."

8.

		

Row 16, Column 3 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:



After "Up to 2 hours - £1.00" insert "Up to 3 hours - £1.70"

9.

	

Row 16, Column 4 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

Delete "2 hours" and insert "3 hours".

10.

	

Paragraph 2(i) of Part II of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

Delete "two hours" and insert "three hours".

11.

	

Paragraph 9 of Part II of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be amended

as follows:

Delete "DOVECOTE MEADOW, AMERSHAM PARKING PLACE" and

insert "AMERSHAM OLD TOWN CAR PARK, AMERSHAM PARKING

PLACE".

12.

	

Paragraph 13 of Part II of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:

After " Group C Parking Places" delete "Dovecote Meadow, Amersham"

and insert "Amersham Old Town Car Park, Amersham".

13.

	

Paragraph 2 of Part III of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be amended

as follows:

After "Chiltern Avenue Car Park" delete "Dovecote Meadow Car Park" and

insert "Amersham Old Town Car Park".

14.

	

Row 10, Column 1 of Part I of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be

amended as follows:



Delete "Dovecote Meadow Amersham" and insert "Amersham Old Town Car

Park Amersham".

15.

	

Article 2(2) of the Original Order shall be amended as follows:

Delete ""reduced penalty charge" means the reduced penalty charge from time

to time determined by the Council under the provisions of the Road Traffic

Act 1991 in accordance with guidance by the Secretary of State."

16.

	

Article 4 of the Original Order shall be amended as follows:

Delete "4(8)" and insert "(8)".

Delete "4(9)" and insert "(9)".

Delete "4(10)" and insert "(10)".

Delete "4(l 1)" and insert "(11)".

Delete "4(12)" and insert "(12)".

17.

	

Paragraph 2 of Part III of the Schedule of the Original Order shall be amended

as follows:

After "Amersham" insert "The" before "Chiltern Pools Car Park".

The COMMON SEAL of
CHILTERN DISTRICT COUNCIL
was hereunto affixed this BSc' day of ' ^

	

14' 2010
in the presence of:

Chairman

Chief Executive


